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ABSTRACT 
Introduction: Addiction to tobacco products such as cigarettes, hookahs, etc. can be caused by psychosocial 

abnormalities that cause physical and psychological dependence of a person who is affected by various factors. 
This study was conducted in 2017 to investigate the association of addiction and quality of life in students of 
Urmia University of Medical Sciences. 
Materials and Methods: This cross-sectional study was on 630 students of Urmia University of Medical Sciences 

in 2016-2017. Data were collected using demographic information questionnaire, identification of people at risk of 
Anise addiction and WHO quality of life questionnaire. Data were collected by SPSS18 and analyzed using linear 
regression, correlation test and descriptive statistics. 
Finding: In this study, the average age of the participants was 22± 13/3 years and (44.4) 280 were male 

participants, Most of the students participated in the entrance study in 2016-2017 and (91.7%) 578 were single 
participants, most of the students participating in the study were The School of Medicine (48.3) was 304 and the 
lowest of the School of Health (11) was 69 The highest average in the sub-abuse tendency to addiction, 
depression, and helplessness 692 (23.87) was. 
Results: The results showed that the highest quality of life for women and men had the highest drug abuse trend 

and the tendency to drug abuse and there was a significant relationship between quality of life. 
Keywords: Abuse tendency to addiction, Quality of Life, Medical Students, Urmia, depression, helplessness. 

 

INTRODUCTION  
Addiction is a social psychological disorder that results 
from the unauthorized use of certain substances, such as 
opium, cannabis, etc. which causes physical and mental 
dependency. Drug addiction has become a global problem 
and has a great financial burden on the healthcare sector. 
Difficulties due to addiction affect the whole life of the 
individual in the family and society and have drifted away 
huge social and spiritual resources that could have been 
spent elsewhere for progressive programs. This 
predicament is very serious, especially in a developing 
country such as Iran, which needs young and efficient 
workforce,  Addiction is often a degenerating process, 
meaning that the individual starts it with light drugs with low 
side effects and falls to heavy narcotics with devastating 
outcomes, starting with the use of legal drugs such as 
cigarettes and eventually leading to the use of illegal drugs 
such as alcohol, inhalers and marijuana(1-3),  The ultimate 
consequence disrupts wellness of the individual and the 
society, People's beliefs and attitudes about drugs and the 
negative and positive consequences of their use are called 
substance abuse tendencies. The tendency to use drugs in 
people's beliefs about drugs and its positive and negative 
consequences should be sought(4, 5). Drugs have caused 
social, economic, political, and health damage in the 
country, including physical and infectious diseases such as 
AIDS and hepatitis, and psychosocial diseases such as 
increased crime-related addiction, theft, murder, rape, and 
child abuse. An increase in the number of divorces and 

difficulties in educating children of addicted parents can be 
mentioned(6).  
Addiction to students occurs under the influence of various 
factors, one of which is the quality of life of students, In 
general, the quality of life does not have clear and identical 
words, although people instinctively understand its 
meaning. There are different theories about quality of life(7, 
8). According to the World Health Organization definition of 
quality of life in people's perception of their position in life in 
terms of culture and value system where they live the quite 
individual quality of life and the understanding of different 
aspects of life, Quality of life has different dimensions such 
as physical health, mental health, economic conditions, 
various dimensions such as physiological and individual 
performance are very important, The importance of quality 
of life in health is such that the present century has been 
described as an improvement in the quality of life and 
health(9, 10). Due to changes in the style and living 
environment of students compared to adults, they face 
more psychological and social problems in their student 
life, Factors such as academic failure, job problems, social 
incompatibility, behavioral problems, personality, and 
marriage have been influential factors on their quality of life 
(11, 12). 
Stress and psychological problems, such as anxiety and 
depression, are common among students, as students 
have consequences for their lifestyle, social relationships, 
and sleep at all times(13), The study conducted on 
students of Tarbiat Modarres University found that 15 
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percent suffer from stress. They also concluded that the 
levels of stress, anxiety, and depression, and quality of life 
in female students were inversely associated with stress, 
anxiety and depression were(14), there is a statistically 
significant relationship between major depression and 
crack addiction. Severe and irrational stress and anxiety for 
everyone cause many problems in a person's daily 
functioning. It is a psychological problem and has been 
seen in many addicts. Sometimes a person tends to use 
drugs and alcohol to control anxiety and. They show their 
stress(15). 
The tendency to addiction and its relationship to quality of 
life among students is an important issue, because it 
reduces their academic success and prevents them from 
reaching a special and worthy position, so to prevent 
students from dropping out and increase their academic 
and fertility. It is essential to better understand the context 
of science, identify students' interest in drugs, and relate 
them to quality of life among students. The very high ratio 
of drug addiction in the country shows the importance of 
conducting numerous studies on the subject; this study 
aimed to investigate the association of addiction and quality 
of life in students of Urmia University of Medical Sciences. 

 
METHODS 
This descriptive cross-sectional study was performed on 
630 students at Urmia University of Medical Sciences in 
2017 by stratified random sampling method. The inclusion 
criteria were: 1- except students of School of Pharmacy, 
dentistry, graduate students and residents but not and 2- at 
least six months have passed from the students studied 
and exclusion criteria 1- Unwillingness to engage students 
and incomplete questionnaire. Then the students entered 
the study in the desired lists separately for men and 
women, which numbered 630 people. 
 Data were collected by demographic questionnaire, a 
questionnaire Anisi and colleagues and WHO quality of life 
questionnaire was used to survey questionnaire with 75 
questions abusing and is four dimensions, The first 
dimension of depression and helplessness has 29 
questions, the second dimension of positive attitude 
towards materials has 18 questions, the third dimension of 
anxiety and fear has 17 questions and the fourth dimension 
of high excitement has 11 questions. Based on a study by 
Anisi et al. Cronbach's alpha total was 0.97 and the 
Guttmann coefficient was 0.97, which has four sections for 
identifying people at risk for addiction, That those parts of 
the desired overall score of between 0 and 55 are at no risk 
scores between 56 and 80 endangered mild, between 81 to 
111 endangered average and higher than 112 and more in 
grave danger with The scoring method is in the form of a 
four-choice Likert that I disagree with not at all (0), I 
disagree / with your opinion (1), to some extent I agree / 
often (2) and I agree / always (3)(16). 
 Also the second questionnaire The Quality of Life 
Questionnaire also has 26 questions, the first 2 questions 
evaluating only the general area of quality of life and the 4 
areas of physical health, mental health, social relations, 
and environmental health with 24 questions (3, 6, 7 and 8 

questions, respectively). Is evaluated(17), The validity and 
reliability of the questionnaire have already been measured 
and confirmed by Nedjat et al. To homogenize all the 
domains, after performing the necessary calculations, a 
score of 4-20 for each domain will be obtained separately, 
in which the score of 4 marks the worst and 20 marks the 
best condition of the desired domain. This score was 
convertible to a score of 0-100, we have used this method 
of scoring is also higher scores indicate better quality of 
life. 
 The data were then collected by SPSS18 and 
analyzed to determine the relationship between the 
variables using linear regression, correlation test and 
descriptive statistics. The data was also checked to find 
whether it follows normal distribution. That all data were 
normally distributed. The anonymity of the respondents 
were also assured in all tests, the error level of less than 
0.05 was assumed to be significant. 

 
RESULTS 
In this study, the average age of the participants was 22 (± 
3.13) years old and 280 (44.4%) and 350 (55.6%) of the 
students were male and female, respectively. School-wise, 
the highest number of participants were from college of 
medicine (n = 304, 48.3%) and the lowest were public 
health students (n = 69, 11%). Also, the highest number of 
participants were students of associate’s and bachelor’s 
degree (n = 327, 51.9%) (Table 1). Additionally, the 
majority of study participants were belonged to the 2015 – 
16 academic year (n = 306, 48.6%) and most of the 
participants were born in 1992 – 3 (n = 226, 35.9%). Plus, 
578 participants were single (91.7%) (Table 1). 
 

Table 1. Demographic data of students according to 
gender, educational level, faculty 

Variables Subgroup Number Percentage 

Gender Man 280 44.4 

Woman 350 55.6 

Faculty medical 304 48.3 

Nursing and 
Midwifery 

115 18.2 

Hygiene 69 11 

Paramedical 142 22.5 

Grade Associate and 
Bachelor 

327 52 

Basic Sciences 145 23 

Extern 103 16.3 

Inter 55 8.7 

 

The highest average in the sub-abuse tendency to 
addiction, depression, and helplessness (23.87) was 692, 
the highest average quality of life and social health branch 
(68.62) 630 was Also, women had the highest quality of life 
with an average of 75.07 (16.79). (P = 0.001) (Table 2), 
also the extern students had the highest quality of life and 
no relationship between quality of life and students' 
education was found. (P = 0.001) 
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Table 2: Descriptive indicators for the sub-branches of addiction and quality of life 
Variables Subgroup Number Mean Standard 

deviation 
maximum minimum 

The tendency to 
Substance Abuse 

Depression and helplessness 629 23.87 16.50 0 84 
Positive attitude to materials 629 8.65 9.44 0 45 
Anxiety and fear 630 15.50 9.01 0 42 
High excitement 630 12.49 5.83 0 29 
Total substance abuse 630 60.41 35.41 0 182 

Quality of Life The overall scope of quality of life 630 73.01 18.52 0 100 
Physical health 630 50.81 13.48 14.29 92.86 
mental health 630 60.11 12.77 8.33 91.67 
Environmental health 630 59.70 15.99 12.50 100 
Social health 630 68.62 19.24 0 100 

 
The results of correlation coefficient analysis found that 
there is a significant positive relationship between 

addiction, quality of life, gender, marital and age (P = 
0.001). (Table 3) 

 

Table 3. The correlation coefficient of addiction to quality of life and its sub-branches 
Variables Abuse tendency to addiction 

R P 

The overall scope of quality of life 0.473 0.001> 
Physical health 0.363 0.001> 
mental health 0.490 0.001> 
Environmental health 0.473 0.001> 
Social health 0.458 0.001> 
gender 0.235 0.001> 

Marital status 0.127 0.001> 

age 0.129 0.001> 

 
The results of regression analysis showed that the 
observed F level (F = 180.68) was significant and 
approximately 22% of the variance of addiction orientation 
was caused by the various quality of life (R2 = 0.222). It is 
positive (Table 4), the results of independent t-test showed 
that there was a significant relationship between two 
groups of male and female students in terms of addiction (t 
= -6.702) and quality of life (t = -6.535) (p = 0.001). (Table 
5) 

The results of descriptive indicators showed that the 
tendency to addiction to four categories of abuse, Lack of 
risk (49.5) was 312, moderate risk (22.7) was 143, 
moderate risk (19.4) was 122, and (8.4) was 53 and were 
higher than the extreme danger. (Table 6) as well as the 
highest addiction potential abuse were male with an 
average69.71 (39.50) was.  

 
Table 4. Results of regression analysis to predict trends in drug abuse by the quality of life 

Predictive 
variable 

R R2 standard 
error 

Non-standard 
coefficients (B) 

Standard 
coefficients (B) 

P t F 

Quality of 
Life 

0.473 0.222 143.52 3.758 -0.473 0.001> 26.01 180.68 

 
Table 5: Test results t to compare students (boys and girls) in the variables of addiction and quality of life 

Variables Subgroup Mean±SD t P_Value 

Abuse tendency to addiction Girl 52.97 ±29.79 
-6.702 <0.001 

Boy 69.71±39.50 

Quality of Life Girl 75.07 ±16.79 
-6.535 <0.001 

Boy 70.44±20.23 

 
Table 6: Results of the frequency and types of addiction-oriented classes 

Research variables Number Percentage 

Lack of risk 312 49.5 

Mild risk 143 22.7 

Moderate risk 122 19.4 

Severe danger 53 8.4 

Total sum 630 100 

DISCUSSION 
Given the importance of addiction problems and the 
growing tendency of young people, especially students, this 
study was conducted to investigate the association of drug 
abuse and quality of life in students. The results of the 

study showed that approximately 22% of addiction is 
caused by a variety of quality of life, Also, in the sub-
categories of substance abuse orientation, depression and 
helplessness, anxiety and fear, high excitement, and 
positive attitude towards drugs were the lowest to the 



Investigating the association of quality of life and addiction in students of Urmia University of Medical Sciences 

 

1837   P J M H S  Vol. 15, NO. 6, JUN  2021 

highest, respectively, which were consistent with the 
studies(18-22), Certainly, addiction is influenced by various 
factors that, due to the significant relationship between 
addiction and the quality of life of universities, are required 
to take appropriate measures and teachings to increase the 
quality of life of students. 
 The highest levels of addiction were initially in the 
basic sciences, undergraduate, interns, and extern (23-26), 
this is probably due to the greater leisure time of these 
students and the risk ability and experience of these 
students in this course of study, which requires more 
attention to this course, which shows the impact of the 
course on the tendency to addiction. 
 Students Nursing and Midwifery depression, anxiety 
and tends to be more material that needs urgent attention 
from other schools more attention to the University Faculty 
exposed to more depression, anxiety and tendency to 
substance, And the highest level of excitement was given 
to paramedical students, which indicates the higher risk of 
students in this college to have emotional fun. 
 The results show that the quality of life for the highest 
scores, respectively, public health, mental health, 
environmental health, physical health and overall quality of 
life as well as average students 73.01 ± 18.52, which 
indicates a good quality, The average score of quality of life 
was 73.01 ± 18.52 indicating a good quality of life. Of life 
for students, Which is not consistent with the results of the 
study of Zia pour et al(23), Soltani et al.(27), Amiri et al(28). 
This was due to the quality of life of the students, the 
establishment of counseling centers, as well as the 
establishment of recreational and sports centers, in other 
universities, the amount of attention to this issue has been 
low. And on the other hand, it can be due to cultural 
conditions and dependence on the family, which is different 
in different universities. 
 Extern students had the highest quality of life. Also, it 
was found that there was a statistically significant relation 
between the quality of life and  educational level, which 
was inconsistent with the study of Amiri et al(28), This was 
probably due to the positive view toward medicin as a 
discipline, as well as the greater support the medical 
students receive from their families, on the other hand, the 
health school, in general, had the highest quality. School-
wise, the highest quality of life was observed at public 
health school  This is probably due to the small number of 
students participating in the study, the average age of the 
participants was 22± 13/3 years old, which is consistent 
with another study(29). This indicates that most students 
are studying and participating in youth studies. 
 In this study, most of the participants were single and 
there was no relationship between marital status and 
substance abuse tendency, but domestic research shows 
that single people are more exposed to substance abuse 
than married people(29, 30). However, some studies show 
that the rate of substance abuse in married people is higher 
than single(31). 
 The results of the study show that the tendency to 
addiction was different between male and female students; 
and male students were more likely to abuse drugs, which 
was consistent with the results of studies of their kind(31-
35), Explaining that entering a new educational 
environment and having different social and educational 

expectations from female and male students in the 
university environment, causes them to experience 
different issues in the educational environment and 
therefore There was a difference in the quality of life 
between the two groups. 
 The strengths of this study are the lack of such a 
study at the university level, especially on the issue and the 
sample size Balabvd and the limitations of this study 
uncooperative students and non-attribution of this study to 
other groups, such as students, the students, because 
each situation differently Which is recommended, In the 
future, along with the quality of life of students, factors such 
as household economic status, number of children, place of 
residence, as well as the correlation of this factor with 
variables such as spiritual health, emotional intelligence, 
religious orientation, health literacy and factors affecting the 
quality of life. 
 

CONCLUSION 
In this study, most of the students participating in the ladies 
singles and the Medical School were also the negative 
attitude to drug use and quality of life of a significant 
positive relationship existed almost 22% Abuse tendency to 
addiction by a variety of subfields of quality of life caused. 
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